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Erskine Golf Club 
Pro-Am  

Friday 12th September 2025 
 

Shotgun start at 10.30am 

 



Erskine Golf Club is delighted to welcome back the Tartan 
Tour in the form of our 2025 Pro-Am in association with 
Prostate Scotland. 

Would you or your friends, staff, clients or customers like the 
opportunity to play at one of the best courses in the area with 
one of the best PGA Professionals in the country? 

The Pro-Am package (for 3 players) includes: 

 A hot roll and coffee before the round 
 18 holes with a top Scottish PGA Professional. 
 On course spot prizes. 
 On course bar and refreshments. 
 The opportunity to advertise your company within the 

clubhouse and on the course. 
 Prizegiving with prizes for the top 3 teams. 
 A meal following your round. 
 The opportunity to speak to Prostate Scotland 

Champions and team members 
 Auctions, raffles and more. 

 
For more information or to book your place at the event, 
please contact: 
 
Kevin McAleer, Erskine Golf Club General Manager 
 
Office: 01505 862302 
Mobile: 07585 950589 
Email: generalmanager@erskinegolfclub.co.uk  

Team packages start at £450 plus VAT with enhanced 
sponsorship packages available on request. 



Prostate Scotland is delighted to be named as the chosen 
charity for the Erskine Golf Club Pro/Am in September.   

"More men in Scotland need to be getting checked to detect 
prostate cancer earlier on. It’s the most common cancer in 
men, impacting 1 in 10 men in Scotland, and the figures are 
rising.  

"It’s important for men to know that early-stage prostate 
cancer doesn't always show symptoms, and with no national 
screening programme for prostate cancer in Scotland or the 
UK, Prostate Scotland advises men from the age of 50 to go to 
their GP and request a prostate-specific antigen (PSA) test. 

"Men who are "high risk of developing prostate cancer”, those 
with a family history – grandad, dad, uncle, brothers, and Afro-
Caribbean men, are advised to get tested as early as 45." 

For men who want to know more, they should visit Prostate 
Scotland’s online symptom checker to be aware of what signs 
to look for: www.prostatescotland.org.uk 



 
 
 

Erskine Golf Club in Bishopton Renfrewshire, near Glasgow, is 
arguably one of the finest golf courses in the West of Scotland 
designed by Troon Professional Willie Fernie, James Braid and 
Dr. Alister MacKenzie. 
 
This golf course simply has to be played to be appreciated. 
The Club was established in 1904 and caters for all, from the 
individual to groups and societies. Erskine Golf Club hosted 
the Scottish Professional Championship in 1991 and also The 
Scottish Youths Championship in 2007. 
 
We hope you can join us for this exciting and prestigious 
event. 
 

 


